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Naomi Feil (right) in a documentary about caring for people with dementia. Validation Training Institute
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“Every cell remembers where it was touched by
the mother,” Naomi Feil says in a clip from a 2007
documentary, viewed millions of times, as she
tends to a patient with severe dementia. The
patient, an elderly woman, seems entirely cut off
from the world, incapable of interaction. Feil sits
across from her in a senior-living facility and
holds both sides of her face, delicately, like an
adoring parent with a young child. Eyes open
only to slits, the woman taps one hand weakly on
the arm of her chair in a repetitive motion. Feil, a
social worker, believed that for patients with
advanced dementia, a “desperate need for
connection” is locked inside, a need often
focused on the distant past. Feil sings a children’s
hymn to the woman, who Feil knows was a
longtime churchgoer. The woman smacks the
chair arm faster, louder. What appeared to be
meaningless motion now seems responsive. She
clutches Feil’s jacket, pulling her close. Feil sings a
second hymn, and the woman, her eyes opening
more fully and meeting Feil’s, whispers a phrase
with her: “whole world in his hands.”

Feil’s approach to people with Alzheimer’s and
other forms of dementia, which she called the
Validation Method, aims for this kind of
breakthrough and bond, no matter how fleeting.
The method builds on her sense that such people
are frequently in a state of yearning, even if they
appear to be totally shut down or randomly,
aggressively acting out. The technique strives to
validate and meet their longing — and it takes a
radical approach to problematic patient
behaviors.

“Let’s say a disoriented old man sees me as a love
object and wants to have sex with me,” Feil wrote
in an unpublished autobiography. She did not shy
away from engaging with the most
uncomfortable aspects of caring for patients who
are not only disoriented but also disinhibited. She
described making sure that her own “judgments
and fears” didn’t dictate her reactions. “If he’s
patting me on my breasts, I might say, ‘Do you
miss her very much?’ using the ambiguous ‘her’
that can mean mother, or wife, or lover,
whoever.” Without encouraging the behavior, she
suggested, a caregiver could turn errant sexual
gestures into a meaningful connection. 

In life’s final phases, the mind tends to reel
backward, Feil maintained, and this should be
honored, not fought. As she developed her
approach, beginning in the late 1960s, she stood
in opposition to a dominant practice, Reality
Orientation, which puts a premium on
reminding and correcting patients about current
facts, from the day of the week to the truth that a
beloved family member is no longer alive. Feil’s
ideas have been a crucial force in an evolution
away from Reality Orientation in dementia care.

The Validation Method’s stress on acute empathy,
its sensitivity to the emotional desperation of
patients, may be rooted in Feil’s extreme
vulnerability as a child. In 1937, as a Jewish 4-
year-old in Nazi Germany, she was hidden by
nuns until her mother managed to escape with
Feil and her younger sister to the United States,
where they joined Feil’s father, who had already
fled.

Her father, a psychologist, ran a Jewish home for
the elderly in Cleveland. The family lived there,
and growing up, Feil, who had no close friends at
school, treasured her relationships with the
residents. In her autobiography, she recalled
sneaking off the grounds repeatedly at night and
venturing to a drugstore and soda fountain with
her “best friend,” a patient with “velvety eyes”
whose teeth were black or missing.

In her early 30s, Feil returned to work at the
home. There, the Validation Method started to
take shape. In 1982, she founded the Validation
Training Institute, and by the 2000s, she was
leading at least 80 workshops a year, from China
and Japan to the United States and almost every
country in Europe. Her eldest child, Vicki de
Klerk-Rubin, who now runs the institute, told me
about her mother’s fierce drive — but also,
toward the end of her life, her cognitive decline
and descent into dark suspicions.

De Klerk-Rubin and two of her siblings
recounted that as Feil became less competent,
and as de Klerk-Rubin shared in leading
workshops or led them solo, Feil began accusing
her daughter of stealing her life’s work. The
allegation inflicted a painful wound.

But de Klerk-Rubin reminded herself that her
mother might well be in the grip of the distant
past. She might be overtaken by the
suspiciousness sewn into her psyche as she hid
from the Nazis and then settled in an alien land.
Feil had long insisted on being paid for
workshops in cash. She kept $20,000 hidden in
her house. It was as if her mother always felt, de
Klerk-Rubin said, that “you never know when the
Nazis are going to come, and you can’t get to the
bank — you should have a stash.”

This, the daughter told herself, was Feil’s reality.
It made her mother’s accusations easier to bear. It
made her mother’s love easier to feel.

Daniel Bergner is a contributing writer for the magazine who
previously wrote about alternate ways of treating psychotic
disorders. He is the author of “The Mind and the Moon: My
Brother’s Story, the Science of Our Brains and the Search for Our
Psyches.”

Mays during a game against the New York Mets at the Polo Grounds in New York, 1962. Art Rickerby/The LIFE Picture
Collection, via Shutterstock

In November 1979, less than four months after he
was inducted into the Hall of Fame, Willie Mays
was banned from Major League Baseball. He was
48, six years into retirement, but he was still one
of the most recognizable athletes on the planet.
He still appeared on talk shows and network
sitcoms. He still got mobbed in restaurants. Kids
who weren’t alive to watch him play still
practiced his basket catch in the backyard and
memorized his iconic numbers: the 660 career
home runs; the .301 lifetime batting average; the
12 Gold Gloves in center field; the 24 All-Star
game appearances (a feat possible only because
M.L.B. hosted two All-Star games per year from
1959 to 1962, and Mays played in all of them).

But he was also deep in debt, which was nothing
new for Mays, except now he was no longer
being paid like a superstar. For much of the
1960s, Mays was baseball’s highest-paid player; in
1970, his salary was $135,000, or about $1.1 million
today. And he always parted easily with his
money. He gave it away to kids in his
neighborhood after stickball games in the street.
He lent it to friends he knew would never pay
him back. He paid his housekeeper’s income
taxes on top of her salary, even as he was in
arrears to the I.R.S. himself. He also liked nice
things: cars, clothes, furniture, houses. After his
first marriage ended in (costly) divorce, he
bought a multilevel home built into the side of a
steep slope overlooking the Golden Gate Bridge,
then added a spiral staircase running from the
living room to the garage level so he could get to
his convertible without going outside.

In the fall of 1979, Mays was making $50,000 a
year as a good-will ambassador for the New York
Mets, the last team he played for, when the
Bally’s Park Place Casino Hotel in Atlantic City
offered him a 10-year contract for $100,000 per
year to spend 10 days a month at the casino as a
celebrity greeter. Sign autographs, take pictures,
tell stories, play golf with the high rollers. Be
Willie Mays. Mays didn’t gamble, or drink, and
even in retirement being Willie Mays depleted
him, but he was always good at it, and he needed
the money. Read More

Shelley Duvall’s distinct style signaled a new kind of female star. Bert Stern/Condé Nast

Legend has it that Shelley Duvall was hosting a
party in Houston in 1970 when a couple of her
guests, crew members on Robert Altman’s new
film, thought it would be good to introduce her
to Altman. She was only 20 and had never acted
before, but that hardly mattered; the wonder of
early Altman is that everyone — even the familiar
faces — seemed to be doing it for the first time.
Not a lot of people saw the film she was
eventually cast in, “Brewster McCloud,” but those
of us who did felt as if we were experiencing the
shock of the new. Keith Carradine would
articulate the feeling four years later when,
gazing at Duvall in Altman’s 1974 film, “Thieves
Like Us,” he says, “I never seen nobody like you
before.”

It was hard to miss the promise in her sweetly
alert gaze. She seemed to be ushering us into the
new decade, offering a preview of the emotional
openness and sexual freedom that potentially lay
ahead. After a decade in which we had to spend a
little too much time with Julie Andrews and
Doris Day, we were now being confronted by the
sexual assertiveness of Glenda Jackson in
“Women in Love” and Barbara Hershey in “Last
Summer” or the slow-burning anger of Carrie
Snodgress in “Diary of a Mad Housewife.”
Duvall’s distinction lay in couching her
assertiveness in something softer, less
threatening, that still let you know she could see
right through any potential romantic partner and
fully expected him not to measure up to much.

After discovering in “Brewster McCloud” that the
boy (Bud Cort) she has effortlessly seduced is a
virgin, she says, “That means that I’m responsible
for you from now on.” Lest that seem a little too
soft, she was ready to remind you that she was
nobody’s pushover. In the same movie, she
concludes the story of an attempted rape by
blithely intoning: “I hit him with a lug wrench.”
Pauline Kael got it right when she wrote that
Duvall “seems able to be herself on the screen in
a way that nobody has ever been before.” 
Read More

The talk-show host Phil Donahue and his frequent guest the sex expert Dr. Ruth Westheimer in 1997.
Andrea Renault/Alamy

Before the answers to life’s questions fit in our
pocket, you used to have to turn a dial. If you
were lucky, Phil Donahue would be on, ready to
guide you toward enlightenment. In a stroke of
deluxe good fortune, Dr. Ruth Westheimer might
have stopped by to be the enlightenment. He was
the search engine. She was a trusted result.

Donahue hailed from Cleveland. The windshield
glasses, increasingly snowy thatch of hair, marble
eyes, occasional pair of suspenders and obvious
geniality said “card catalog,” “manager of the ’79
Reds,” “Stage Manager in a Chevy Motors
production of ‘Our Town.’” Dr. Ruth was
Donahue’s antonym, a step stool to his straight
ladder. She kept her hair in a butterscotch
helmet, fancied a uniform of jacket-blouse-skirt
and came to our aid, via Germany, with a voice of
crinkled tissue paper. Not even eight years
separated them, yet so boyish was he and so
seasoned was she that he read as her grandson.
(She maybe reached his armpit.) Together and
apart, they were public servants, American
utilities.

Donahue was a journalist. His forum was the talk
show, but some new strain in which the main
attraction bypassed celebrities. People — every
kind of them — lined up to witness other people
being human, to experience Donahue’s radical
conduit of edification, identification, curiosity,
shock, wonder, outrage, surprise and dispute, all
visible in the show’s televisual jackpot: cutaways
to us, reacting, taking it all in, nodding, gasping.
When a celebrity made it to the “Donahue” stage
— Bill Clinton, say, La Toya Jackson, the Judds —
they were expected to be human, too, to be
accountable for their own humanity. From 1967
to 1996, for more than 6,000 episodes, he
permitted us to be accountable to ourselves. 
Read More

James Earl Jones in 1969, during the filming of ‘‘The Great White Hope.’’ Lawrence Schiller

When James Earl Jones was a small child, he
stopped talking. He was born in Arkabutla, Miss.,
and learned to love its gullies and rises and deep
ravines and the loam enriched by the Mississippi
River and the way it felt against his bare feet. His
parents had left him to his maternal
grandparents, and when he was 5 or 6 they
moved to Dublin, Mich., reluctantly taking the
boy with them. He was devastated. The move
opened opportunities for the family, but was a
profound rupture for the young Jones. “The
move from Mississippi to Michigan was
supposed to be a glorious event,” he remembered
in his 1993 memoir, “Voices and Silences.” “For
me it was a heartbreak.”

Jones would later characterize himself as mute.
It’s not that he couldn’t speak, but when he did it
was with a terrible stutter that he developed after
moving to Michigan. Before strangers, he
wouldn’t muster his words. “I talked to my family
in basic terms,” he wrote. His grandmother
allowed him to skip church, the only place that
would force him to struggle through words
during those years.

Though he refused to talk with other people, his
time in Mississippi taught him to listen. “Out in
the country, with few books or strangers, and no
such thing as television,” he wrote, “we depended
on the stories we knew.” His grandmother told
bedtime stories about “women cursed to wear
the heads of mules and men who had bellies full
of writhing snakes.” His family spoke of his great-
grandparents, Wyatt Connolly and Sharlett
Jeeter, and the 300 acres of Mississippi land they
cultivated. Read More

Unexpected deaths led Paul Auster to believe that “the world was capricious and unstable, that the
future can be stolen from us at any moment.” Spencer Ostrander

In late July 1961, 14-year-old Paul Auster was
hiking with a group of boys from his sleepaway
camp when a storm stole over the horizon.
Lightning “danced around us like spears,” Auster
later recalled, turning “everything a bright
ghostly white” and striking a camper named
Ralph. Trapped in a meadow, far from the safety
of camp, Auster stood watch over Ralph’s blue
and cooling body, using his finger to prevent the
boy from swallowing his own tongue. “In spite of
the mounting evidence,” Auster said, “it never
occurred to me that he wasn’t going to come
around.”

Death had marked Auster, and not for the final
time. He had already mourned the sudden loss of
one grandmother (heart attack) and would soon
mourn the slow demise of the other to A.L.S., a
disease, Auster observed, that seemed to leave its
victims with “no hope, no remedy, nothing in
front of you but a prolonged march towards
disintegration. …” Later there were the deaths of
his mother and father; a horrific car crash in
which the lives of his second wife, Siri Hustvedt,
and their daughter, Sophie, were somehow
spared (“We should be dead,” Auster later said);
and finally the passing of his 10-month-old
granddaughter Ruby, and his son, Daniel, who
overdosed in 2022. By then, Auster had long since
decided that “the world was capricious and
unstable, that the future can be stolen from us at
any moment, that the sky is full of lightning bolts
that can crash down and kill the young as well as
the old, and always, always, the lightning strikes
when we are least expecting it.”

Sadness permeated Auster’s work like storm
water: In his novels and memoirs — and in a
range of collected and uncollected essays —
rarely is anyone left dry. “Paul was extremely
interested in the idea of the hero who is cast into
a new world by grief,” Hustvedt says. “He used
that device a lot: the stripped person. The person
who has lost their most profound connections to
the world. And I’d argue that it goes all the way
back to ‘The New York Trilogy.’” Read More

Michaela DePrince in 2014. Philippe Vogelenzang/Trunk Archive

In 1999, when Michaela DePrince was just 4
years old, she saw an image that would change
her life: a ballerina in a “glittering pink skirt,”
standing en pointe on the cover of a magazine.
Born Mabinty Bangura, she was living in the Safe
Haven orphanage in Sierra Leone, having been
sold there by an uncle after the deaths of both of
her parents during the country’s civil war.

At the orphanage, Mabinty stood out. She spoke
five languages, having picked them up at the
marketplace and with her father, and had an
indefatigable curiosity; her neck, clavicle and
arms were speckled with tiny light-colored
patches, a result of vitiligo. The orphanage
ranked the children — 24 girls and three boys —
based on which were thought to be the most
adoptable; because of her skin condition,
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adoptable; because of her skin condition,
Mabinty was ranked last. Her time in the
orphanage was very hard: She suffered physical
abuse by the “aunties” who were in charge and
survived an attack by rebel soldiers who
murdered her favorite teacher. To make life
bearable, she told stories, sang, created dancing
games and became best friends with the girl
ranked No. 26. She used her imagination as a
shield against the place’s cruelties, playing
pretend in order to ward off the aunties. “I am a
witch,” she told one of them. “I will place a spell
on you if you harm me.”

Months into her time at the orphanage, Mabinty
was walking in a windstorm when the cover of
the magazine blew into her face. “Someday I will
dance on my toes like this lady,” she thought. “I
will be happy too!” Shortly after, she and her best
friend were adopted by Elaine and Charles
DePrince, who took them home to Cherry Hill,
N.J. At the time, the couple were the parents of
three boys and had recently lost two others
because H.I.V.-infected blood was used in the
treatment of their hemophilia. The girls were
renamed Michaela and Mia. Read More

Bob Newhart on “The Bob Newhart Show.” CBS, via Getty Images

People who met Bob Newhart weren’t always
sure why he looked so familiar. Women on
elevators often told him that he reminded them
of their ex-husbands; men sometimes asked him
if they served together in the war. Newhart just
had that kind of face, an average white
Midwestern sort of face, a face that always
looked a little disappointed in itself.

For a long time, Newhart felt that way. His
childhood home was as impersonal as a
boardinghouse, he once said in an interview.
More often than not, his father spent his evenings
at a neighborhood bar near their house in
Chicago; even when he was around, he never
said much at meals. (“Maybe now Dad will notice
me,” Newhart wrote in his memoir, “I Shouldn’t
Even Be Doing This!” describing his thoughts as
he walked up to collect one of the three
Grammys he received in 1961.) Growing up,
Newhart filled a void in himself, he once told a
literary magazine, by peopling his imaginary
world with characters who would entertain him.
“I think that’s true of all comedians,” he said.

Of the family’s four children, Newhart was the
weakest student. Law school didn’t work out; he
tired of accounting. At 29, when his friends were
already married, having children and settling into
careers, Newhart was single and living unhappily
at home, too broke to pay rent. Somehow he
summoned the self-confidence to try something
new. He was funny, people always told him.
Maybe he could make a living off that. 
Read More

Eleanor Coppola on the set of “Apocalypse Now” around 1976. James Keane, via Zoetrope

Eleanor Coppola met Francis Ford Coppola
when she was 26. He was directing his first
feature, a 1963 horror film titled “Dementia 13,”
and Eleanor was his assistant art director. Months
later, she found out she was pregnant. They
married the following weekend in Las Vegas. She
imagined that they would continue to work
together. Instead, she found herself supporting
her husband’s career. “My dad was this
traditional Italian who had an idea of a wife’s
role,” Eleanor’s daughter, Sofia, told me.

Eleanor knew how people saw her because they
often told her. “Too small for such a big husband,”
a crew member on “Apocalypse Now” told
Eleanor, who weighed 99 pounds. Diane Keaton
told Eleanor that she was her model for Kay, the
quiet WASP who married into the Corleone
family in “The Godfather.” And yet it was Eleanor
who so sharply recorded her husband in “Hearts
of Darkness,” a 1991 documentary about the
making of “Apocalypse Now.” Francis’s epic
struggle to get his film made, driving himself to
the edge of bankruptcy and his own ego, appears
in stark contrast to Eleanor’s calm, steady
narration. “He gathers up his Oscars and throws
them out the window,” she wrote in “Notes,” a
1979 collection of diary entries that also served as
the film’s voice-over. “The children pick up the
pieces.”

In a second memoir, “Notes on a Life,” Eleanor
described her “internal war” between being an
artist and a wife and mother. While Francis made
his films, Eleanor wrote, “I attend to little tasks.”
She shopped for children’s shoes, mops, frying
pans, kitchen towels, firmer pillows, fresh
flowers, groceries, wastebaskets, trash bags,
laundry detergent, doormats, shampoo, duplicate
keys. She tended to faucets, fridges, sinks,
gardens, heaters, landscapers and sick children in
hotel rooms where the windows never opened.
Often she found herself descending into a
depression. She went to psychologists and asked
what was wrong with her. Not one, she wrote,
diagnosed her as a creative person. Read More

Frankie Beverly, whose 1981 “Before I Let Go” achieved an undeniable centrality in Black America.
David Corio/Redferns

The night Frankie Beverly died, his grandson,
Brandon Beverly, left the hospital where he had
been at his grandfather’s side and drove to the
singer’s California home. On a normal night,
Brandon would have put his phone on “do not
disturb” before going to sleep. But exhausted, he
forgot.

At 7 a.m., the incessant vibrating of that phone
woke him up. Just an hour after the
announcement of Beverly’s death was posted to
social media, thousands of fans across the world
were pouring out their memories of being
touched by Beverly’s music.

Even though in the coming days, some obituaries
of the Philadelphia-born singer noted that he had
never achieved mainstream success, Brandon
knew that his grandfather never really sought it.
Beverly made music for Black people, and Black
people loved him for it.

If Black gatherings have an anthem, without
question, it’s Beverly’s R&B song “Before I Let
Go,” which he wrote for his band, Maze. It
doesn’t matter the region of the country, or the
age of the crowd — there isn’t a reunion or
barbecue or house party or graduation where the
revelers at some point don’t line up, as if on
command, to do the electric slide as they join
Beverly in crooning:

“You know I think the sun rises and shines on
you/You know there’s nothin’, nothin’, nothin’ I
would not do/Whoa, no/Before I let you go …
/Ohhh … /I would never, never, never, never,
never, never, never/Never let you go, before I
go.” Read More

Jerry West of the Los Angeles Lakers guarded by the Boston Celtics’ Bill Russell in Game 1 of the 1965 N.B.A. Finals.
Bettmann Archive, via Getty Images

It was the summer of 1969, and Jerry West
couldn’t sleep.

He was one of the greatest basketball players on
Earth, an athlete whose grace and drive had
transported him from the dirt roads of rural West
Virginia to the glitz of Los Angeles arenas.

But he was a loser. There was no polite way to say
it, and he wouldn’t hear otherwise. He had just
led his team, the Los Angeles Lakers, to the
N.B.A. Finals for the sixth time. And for the sixth
time, he and his team had lost.

And if that wasn’t cruel enough, he lost each
championship to the same opponent: the smug,
invincible, hated Boston Celtics. The 1969 series
was tied 3-3 when they played the seventh game
in Los Angeles. Despite West’s heroics, the
Lakers lost, again, and there’s a photograph of
him leaving the court in stunned defeat. He’s
walking slowly, one foot in front of the other,
shoulders squared. His hamstring bound in tape,
his eyes sunken sockets — a prisoner on his way
back to his cell. In his memoir, “West by West,”
he captioned the photo: “Where do I go?”

West played so spectacularly well in that losing
series, averaging nearly 38 points per game, that
he was awarded the Finals M.V.P. — the first and
only time the losing star has ever been so
recognized. As a prize, the league gave him a
brand-new Dodge Charger. He fantasized about
blowing it up with dynamite. Read More

Gena Rowlands in 1961. Julian Wasser/TV Guide, via Everett Collection

On the set of the 1968 film “Faces,” Gena
Rowlands was sure she saw the end of her
marriage looming. The director — John
Cassavetes, a pioneer of American independent
cinema — was her husband, and in her memory,
he hated what she was doing. “The first day you
realize your husband doesn’t love you anymore,”
she remembered. “The second day that he never
loved you, the third that he hates you … and after
that it gets bad.”

Rowlands’s relationship with her husband turned
out to be altogether sturdier and richer than she
imagined. By the time Cassavetes died in 1989,
they had made 10 films together, including “A
Woman Under the Influence” (1974) and “Gloria”
(1980), each of which earned Rowlands an Oscar
nomination for best actress. In Cassavetes,
Rowlands found a partner who shared her vision
of film as a way to convey the delirious
turbulence of experience. And in Rowlands,
Cassavetes found an actor who imbued his
movies with their instinctive dynamism.

The daughter of a politician father and a stay-at-
home mother (who would herself go on to act),
Rowlands suffered from various chronic illnesses
in childhood. “I wasn’t much of a handful,” she
recalled to NPR’s Terry Gross in 2016. “I was
lying around and looking pale and reading books
and things.” Reading taught her that one life
could encompass many lives, that she didn’t have
to be one person. Acting, to her, was like reading:
an entry point into the multiplicity of fiction and
the explorations it made possible. Read More

Ivan Boesky after pleading guilty to one count of securities fraud in 1987. Getty Images

Marianne Boesky was in college in Vermont
when federal marshals delivered her infamous 51-
year-old father, Ivan, to the Lompoc federal
prison camp in central California in March 1988
to begin serving his three-year sentence for
insider trading. It was a long trip from Burlington
— especially on the budget airline People Express
— but she made it as often as she could to visit
the inmate who once played her Chopin’s
nocturnes on the piano of their rambling
Westchester estate at bedtime.

Ivan Boesky grew up comfortably, if
unglamorously, in Detroit; his father, a Russian
Jewish immigrant, owned a chain of local bars
with strip shows called the Brass Rail. Ivan never
graduated from college and needed five years to
get through Detroit College of Law, but he
married rich. His wife, Seema Silberstein, was the
daughter of a Detroit-based real estate developer
who owned the Beverly Hills Hotel. Her father
thought Boesky was beneath her but nevertheless
set the young couple up with an apartment on
Park Avenue, and Boesky started working on
Wall Street.

His ascent began in earnest in 1981, with the
establishment of the Ivan F. Boesky Corporation.
The timing was auspicious. The mergers-and-
acquisitions business was just starting to explode
with the emergence of junk bonds, which
enabled corporate raiders to initiate hostile
takeover bids, loading up on debt and then
transferring it to the acquired company. Boesky
specialized in arbitrage, an esoteric form of
investing that involved gambling on these
takeovers. Information on possible targets was of
great value — the more “inside” the better. 
Read More

Hettie Jones in the 1960s. From the Jones family

“Unlike any woman in my family or anyone I’d
ever actually known, I was going to become —
something, anything, whatever that meant,”
Hettie Jones once wrote. She was, from her
earliest memories, an ambitious, daring person
who shrugged off the conventions binding young
women in 1950s Queens. When she left New
York for college in Virginia, she was Hettie
Cohen, and she had never set foot in the house of
a non-Jewish person; but, she figured, the farther
from home the better.

After college, she moved back to the city to
attend graduate school at Columbia. Eventually,
she grew interested in the downtown arts scene,
took a job at a jazz magazine and dropped out.
She soon met a young Black writer named LeRoi
Jones. They fell in love and married in 1958,
when interracial marriage was still an incendiary
proposition: She was never again welcome in her
parents’ home.

The Joneses fell in with the New Bohemia scene
in Greenwich Village. At night, they went to hear
poetry at the cafes and jazz at a club in Cooper
Square called the Five Spot, where artists like
Thelonious Monk and Wayne Shorter were
regulars. “It seemed as if another, new language
had been offered me,” she wrote in her memoir,
“How I Became Hettie Jones.” The Joneses’
apartment became a hub for fellow artists. Hettie
later joked that the entire avant-garde scene fit in
her living room. The couple started a magazine,
Yūgen, and published work by their friends —
Jack Kerouac, Frank O’Hara, Allen Ginsberg,
Diane di Prima and others. The dark tights, flat
shoes and black turtlenecks Hettie and her
friends wore became the signature of a
countercultural style that designers soon tried to
emulate. One day she realized that the
mannequins in a store window were dressed to
look like them. “It felt odd to have so prompted
the culture,” she wrote, “to have many other
women want to seem to be you, whatever they
thought you were.” Read More

Peter Buxtun Liz Hafalia/The San Francisco Chronicle, via Getty Images

One afternoon in the mid-1960s at a U.S. Public
Health Service clinic in San Francisco, Peter
Buxtun heard an unnerving story. An Alabama
doctor had been reprimanded by the federal
government for giving a shot of penicillin — the
standard of care — to a man with late-stage
syphilis. The doctor, government officials
complained, had tainted one of its subjects in a
syphilis study.

A doctor in trouble for helping a sick man?
Research in which patients are not treated for an
infectious disease, which they may pass on to
their sexual partners? Buxtun, who was in his late
20s, knew plenty about syphilis. As a venereal-
disease investigator, he spoke to men about the
risk of V.D. — he was known as the best
interviewer in the office — and encouraged them
and their sexual partners to be tested.

Buxtun contacted the Communicable Disease
Center (later known as the Centers for Disease
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Center (later known as the Centers for Disease
Control and Prevention), which was overseeing
the study run by another federal agency. In
response, he received a manila envelope on “The
Tuskegee Study for Untreated Syphilis in the
Negro Male.” The study, underway since 1932,
was designed to track the untreated progression
of syphilis.

The researchers had initially recruited roughly
600 male subjects: around 400 with tertiary-stage
syphilis; another 200 in the control group who
tested negative. The government persuaded the
men to participate by offering hot meals during
medical-exam days, free health care for minor
ailments and burial insurance. The subjects were
all Black men from Macon County and the
surrounding region in Alabama. Many were
sharecroppers and poor.

To Buxtun’s shock, the researchers never told the
men they had syphilis. Instead, they said they had
“bad blood,” a colloquial phrase that could refer
to numerous ailments. Some of the subjects
underwent painful spinal taps so doctors could
learn if the infection had spread to their nervous
system. No matter how sick they grew, despite
the availability of penicillin beginning in the
1940s, the treatment was the same: tonics and
aspirin.  Read More

The Shangri-Las in 1966. From left: Mary Ann Ganser, Betty Weiss and Mary Weiss. David Dalton

Imagine you are a young girl growing up in
poverty in New York City in the 1950s. Your
father died when you were a few weeks old, and
your family has been without a social safety net
ever since. But there is a salvation, maybe the
only one — rock ’n’ roll. You love Elvis, and the
Everly Brothers, and soon discover that you have
a voice, too. You, your older sister and two
friends, also sisters, start harmonizing on street
corners. The group moves on to sock hops and
local shows, and then by some small miracle gets
to record a couple of songs. They are frothy but
forgettable, an escape, however fleeting.

At that point Mary Weiss, her sister, Betty, and
the twins Mary Ann and Margie Ganser could
have gone back to high school and years later
reminisced about “that time we got to make a
record.” But one day in the spring of 1964, a
former gang member turned songwriter named
George Morton pulled over to the side of the
road and scribbled out a few lines, lines that
turned into a song in search of a female voice.
Just not the kind of voice that had been singing
about soldier boys and boys so fine, parties and
dancing and baby loves. This voice had to allow
pain, the kind of pain so unbearable that the song
needed a second section in which the anguish
was whispered, alluded to, with a chorus of sea
gulls weeping in the background. The song found
its way to 15-year-old Mary, who poured every bit
of the struggle of her life into it. By the end of the
summer, “Remember (Walkin’ in the Sand)” was
shaking up the sunny, sparkly Top 40 of the
Beach Boys and the Supremes.

The song’s success whisked Mary and her group,
called the Shangri-Las, out of their Queens
neighborhood and into the Oz of show business.
Building on “Remember,” they created what can
only be called a kind of pop noir, and not just
because in a few of their biggest hits, like “Leader
of the Pack,” people literally died. Their records
had an authentic street sensibility, populated as
they were by other-side-of-the-tracks characters
— a repentant runaway, more than one noble
greaser — who loved hard and suffered hard.
While much of the credit for the Shangri-Las’ hits
has gone to the creative team behind them, few
other singers could have pulled off that material,
that attitude. In her lead vocals, Mary turned on
the pathos tap and kept it running full. Even in
the upbeat “Give Him a Great Big Kiss,” she gave
overemoting a good name. Read More

Pete Rose signing bats in the Philadelphia Phillies’ locker room in 1980 to celebrate his 10th 200-hit
season. Bill Ingraham/Associated PressAmong the many indignities of being Pete Rose

— and he was, for the last 35 years of his life,
eager to tally them — one seemed to strike him as
especially cruel: Here was a Cincinnati kid-made-
good so revered for his feats on the diamond that
they named a street outside the ballpark Pete
Rose Way. And yet he was not allowed in the
clubhouse. “I mean, that’s the way you treat Al
Capone,” Rose told a local TV station shortly
before his death, seated before a Warhol silk-
screen print of himself.

This was the Pete Rose way: defiant but pleading,
self-regarding and self-pitying, semi-persuasive
despite his persistent self-sabotage.

As a ballplayer, Rose was a blazing throwback,
relentless to the point of mania — the man fans
called Charlie Hustle. His uniform was
perpetually caked in infield dirt. His Monkees
haircut convulsed on impact with each headfirst
slide. Sportswriters summoned near-carnal
language to describe his dedication. “There’s
something almost obscene about watching Pete
Rose play baseball,” one account began.
“Anything that someone enjoys that much must
be illegal or immoral.” He was a serial All-Star
across 24 seasons, most of them spent in
Cincinnati, and the whirring motor of the Big
Red Machine, as the team was known at its 1970s
apex. His signature was the backbreaking single,
swatted between fielders. His record of 4,256
career hits has stood for nearly four decades, as
close to untouchable as Rose once was. (No
active big-leaguer has more than 2,300.) 
Read More

Janice Burgess, creator and executive producer of “The Backyardigans,” at the 35th annual Creative
Arts Emmy Awards in 2008. The show received the award for outstanding special class animated
program. Marc Bryan-Brown

For parents, cartoons are like weather. We can
control plenty else in our children’s lives: their
legal names and bedroom furniture and the color
of the tiny shoelaces on their tiny shoes. But
exactly which bright animated characters
(SpongeBob, He-Man, Bluey) will colonize our
homes and minds and souls during a child’s
formative years — this is largely out of our
control. We’re at the mercy of mysterious
powers. So I consider myself extremely lucky
that during my daughter’s preschool years, Janice
Burgess was one of those powers.

Burgess created a show called “The
Backyardigans.” The title refers to five chubby
computer-generated animals: a moose, a hippo, a
kangaroo, a penguin and an unclassifiable
creature named Uniqua. In each episode, these
friends meet up in their adjoining backyards to
imagine their way into some deep adventure.
They are polar explorers looking for a yeti, or
pirates searching for treasure, and their
imaginations are so strong that all the yards
morph into that make-believe world — until,
eventually, they get hungry and go back inside for
snack time.

That’s it. That’s the whole show. It may not sound
like much, but “The Backyardigans” was special.
It was, on multiple levels, absurdly ambitious.
The show was a musical, and each episode was
scored in a completely different genre: funk,
swing, tarantella, klezmer, rockabilly, Dixieland,
Bollywood and dozens more. Plots were often
drawn from classic film or literature. When the
tubby little characters danced, it was not generic
cartoon dancing — it was meticulously
choreographed and performed by Alvin Ailey-
trained dancers, before being translated into
C.G.I. Read More

Angela Bofill in New York City in 1981. Mick Rock

Angela Bofill sang, with equal élan, from the crest
and canyon of her contralto. The singer and
songwriter was admired for her three-and-a-half-
octave range but beloved because she pulled
from an even bigger quiver of emotion. A Latina
from Harlem and the Bronx who began writing
songs as a child, Bofill was a vocal prodigy who
also played piano and viola. She was a scholarly
and ambitious teenager, a standout among
ruthlessly vetted standouts in elite ensembles like
the New York All City High School Chorus and
the Dance Theater of Harlem chorus. Bofill, who
was of Puerto Rican and Cuban descent, also
sang in a Latin R&B band. This affiliation led to a
record deal. In her early 20s, she signed with a
jazz-fusion label and began recording songs she
had completed as homework while attending
Hunter College High School and the Manhattan
School of Music. It was a period of intense
creativity.

On her debut album, “Angie,” in 1978, Bofill made
stunning tonal choices, which stretch from pale
apology to shuddering requests for faith. The
album is a euphonic achievement, though only a
relative few appreciated Bofill’s majesty. She
quickly became successful in Black spaces and on
Black radio. But because of the racial segregation
of everything from music discovery to marketing
to magazines to the aisles of record stores,
winning in the larger and more lucrative world of
pop was like hitting the lottery.

Bofill’s signature song, the ballad “I Try,” appears
on her second album, “Angel of the Night,” from
1979. In the song, as on the smoldering cover
photo, it’s twilight, and she’s entreating an ex-
lover. Her lyrics are atremble with diaristic
despair. The last three verses are nearly
identically written, almost identically sung, and
the tension comes from the plush pockets of air
within lines: “You know … that I … tried … to be
with you/You know … that I … wanted … to see it
through.” In those rests is the promise that Bofill’s
tone might switch from plain-spoken to pleading.
But it never does. The effect is pure incantation.
Even as she calls out, “I tried and I tried and I
tried and I tried,” Bofill is blue but does not beg.
This was also her approach to mainstream
attention — she intended to excel, but she didn’t
grovel for the industry’s approval. Read More

Edward Stone with a model of a Voyager spacecraft in 1980. Caltech Archives

In 1972, Edward Stone was working as a physics
professor at the California Institute of
Technology when he was asked to become the
lead scientist for a new, hugely ambitious NASA
mission to the solar system’s outer planets. The
mission involved two identical ships to be
launched in 1977 on a trajectory to Jupiter and
Saturn; after that, one ship might also go on to
Uranus and Neptune. Eleven different teams
would be responsible for the 11 science
instruments on each spacecraft. Though Stone’s
specialty was cosmic rays, the subatomic
particles that emanate from exploding stars, his
main job would be to manage a potentially
unruly scientific corps of nearly 100 people.

Internal tensions are inevitable on a big space
project. A ship might require a certain flight path
or orientation, for instance, to ensure optimal
viewing conditions for its cameras, but at the
expense of some other scientific reading (an
ultraviolet sensor, say). With the probes
swooping past planets at upward of 30,000 miles
per hour, observation opportunities would be
brief, the trade-offs unpleasant. What Stone came
to realize, he later told an oral historian of
Voyager, as the project eventually came to be
known, is that “if you decide to do this versus
that, because you can’t do both, you’re basically
deciding that this team gets to make a discovery
and that one doesn’t.”

Stone’s first demonstration of organizational
acumen came during an early meeting of the
science team. His sharp intellect — “Whenever I
talked to him,” his colleague Alan Cummings
recalls, “I felt like I was talking to the smartest
person I’d ever met” — did not preclude a sense
of humility. He was, according to his daughter
Janet Stone, “a true lifelong learner” who could
devote extraordinary amounts of time to
anything necessary for his job. Warren Keller,
from NASA headquarters, once said that at the
first meeting, when each of the scientists — the
primary investigators, or P.I.s — stood up to
explain their Voyager instruments, “Ed Stone
knew more about every one of their instruments
than the P.I.s themselves knew. This man was
tremendous.” Read More

Wafa Al-Udaini at the shore in Gaza in 2021. From Yusuf El-Mbayed

The Mediterranean Sea traces the 25-mile-long
stretch of coastal land that makes up Gaza; for
many people there, it is a lifeline. The poet
Mahmoud Darwish understood those waters as
the sole possession of Palestinians, writing in his
poem “The Strangers’ Picnic”: “I will embrace a
wave and say: Take me to the sea again. This is
what the fearful do: when a burning star
torments them, they go to the sea.”

Wafa Al-Udaini grew up entranced by that same
sea. The waters offered relief for overheated
bodies, a backdrop for gatherings, fish to grill for
dinner. When the Israeli military destroyed clean-
water wells and desalination plants, it became
essential in a different way: It was a place to wash
dishes, do laundry and, occasionally, under
extreme duress, even drink.

When Al-Udaini became a journalist, she traced
the story of Israel’s occupation of Gaza by its
impact on the water and, in turn, on the lives of
those who depended on it. This was also her way
of ensuring that the story of Palestinians was not
told only by the number of civilians killed or
bombs dropped. Read More

Wally Amos outside the original Famous Amos cookie shop on Sunset Boulevard in Hollywood in 1977. David Strick/Redux

He was “Famous” before he was famous — but
names have power, and it didn’t take long for
reality to catch up. In March 1975, Wally Amos
sent out 2,500 invitations to the opening of the
first Famous Amos shop, on a somewhat seedy
corner of Sunset Boulevard in Los Angeles. There
was valet parking and Champagne. Amos
printed glossy “headshots” of his new product,
luridly bulging with chunks of pecan and
chocolate. The conceit was that the former talent
agent was promoting his newest client, the
Cookie. But it was Amos who was about to
become a star.

Raised in Tallahassee, Fla., with a teenage
diversion to live with his Aunt Della in Harlem,
Amos had already spent over a decade in show
business, after dropping out of high school. In
the mailroom at the William Morris Agency in
New York City, he used his lunch hours to
practice his typing skills, eventually becoming
the company’s first Black agent. He was
responsible for signing Simon and Garfunkel.
Passed over for a promotion, he set out on his
own in 1967, opening a talent-management
company in Los Angeles. Along the way, Amos
came up with a gimmick: bringing bags of
homemade chocolate chip cookies to his
meetings. He credited the inspiration to the ones
Della used to bake for him. The resulting warm
feelings paid off: Among the first investors in
Famous Amos were Marvin Gaye and Helen
Reddy.

With his beard, Panama hat and flowing,
embroidered shirts, Amos was the picture of
1970s fabulosity, even managing to make his ever-
present kazoo seem sort of groovy. For a stretch,
he was everywhere — in the Macy’s
Thanksgiving Day Parade; on the cover of Time,
featured as one of the “Hot New Rich”; on “Taxi”
as a hallucination of the character Latka. 
Read More
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Rosa at the Monterey Bay Aquarium in California. Tyson V. Rininger/Monterey Bay Aquarium

No one knows how Rosa was orphaned in
September 1999, in Santa Cruz County, Calif. She
was nameless then, just 4 weeks old and tiny, a
pair of big black eyes and a five-pound ball of
tawny fluff. Where was her mother? Waylaid by
stormy seas? Mortally wounded by a great-white-
shark bite? Entangled in fishing nets? Floating
face down somewhere, her brain infected by
parasites?

There are so many ways for a sea-otter pup to be
separated from its mother, and yet until it
reaches 6 months, its survival in the wild is
impossible without a mother. A pup’s fur coat is
so buoyant that Rosa couldn’t dive for food on
her own without popping back to the surface like
a beach ball. Such a little otter needs a mother for
milk and comfort and the training needed to gain
essential skills like fur grooming and bivalve
cracking. And if that baby grows tired or cold,
she needs to be pulled up to dry off and sleep on
the lifeboat of her mother’s belly.

After a beachgoer spotted the stranded baby
otter, Rosa ended up at the Monterey Bay
Aquarium, where the mission goes beyond just
public exhibitions; aquarium scientists and policy
experts work on all kinds of conservation issues.
It was there, inside a building visited by two
million people a year, that this motherless otter
became a sort of super-auntie for the struggling
population of Southern sea otters, which are
listed as threatened under the Endangered
Species Act. Read More

Share full article

ADVERTISEMENT

Discover The Times with our best offer: $0.50/week for your first year.

https://help.nytimes.com/hc/en-us/articles/115014792127-Copyright-notice
https://www.nytco.com/
https://help.nytimes.com/hc/en-us/articles/115015385887-Contact-Us
https://help.nytimes.com/hc/en-us/articles/115015727108-Accessibility
https://www.nytco.com/careers/
https://advertising.nytimes.com/
https://www.tbrandstudio.com/
https://www.nytimes.com/privacy/cookie-policy#how-do-i-manage-trackers
https://www.nytimes.com/privacy/privacy-policy
https://help.nytimes.com/hc/en-us/articles/115014893428-Terms-of-service
https://help.nytimes.com/hc/en-us/articles/115014893968-Terms-of-sale
https://www.nytimes.com/sitemap/
https://help.nytimes.com/hc/en-us
https://www.nytimes.com/subscription?campaignId=37WXW
https://www.nytimes.com/interactive/2024/12/20/magazine/dogs-cats-pets-friends.html

